
i 
~ , , , 

~G. 
~U_---~-;;: 

. )' -.,- : ... ~ .. ".' . 

.' .. SERIESIN~. 3 

OFFICIAL ··G···· ···A~ . ······Z····· 'E' ·······'r·.·····1·· ······E····· .- ',.: :.- '. ,'- :.",", .. : ,.'. . 

" , ' 

" ' - .' . 

," .. 

GOVERNMENT OF'"GOA, DAMAN. AND DIU 
'. , .. ' ~ '. > . , 

GOVERNMENT OF .. GOA.DAtviAN 

AND DIU 

~ublic Works aRd Urban Development Department 
Panaji Planning' and: Development Authority 

Notification 

Whereas by Notification No.. 4-10-83-k\ ~ 
dated 5-11-1984 and published In· the' OffICIal 
Gazette No. 33 Series I, . dated 15-11:-1984, Govern­
ment had published the Goa, Da.man and Diu, Town 
and Country Planning (Planning. and Development 
Authorities) (Fifth Amendment) Rules, 1984, 
wherein the· maximum and minimum Development 
Charges that may be levied by .a Planning and 
Development Authority have been prescribed and 
alSo the time andtnafiner of filing art appeal under 
section 103 of the Goa, Daman and Diu, Town and 
Country Planning Act, 1974 (hereinafter called the 
said "Act").' . 

Now, therefore, pursuant to section 100 of the 
said Act, and as per approval of the Government 
conveyed by Under Secretary (P.W. & U. D.)'sletter 
No .. 4/10/83-LAWD dated 30-3-1985 following shall 
be the rates of Development Charges and procedure 
for applying. for Development Charges, mode of 
payment of Development Charges, ·etc.: -: . 

1) Rates of Developme1!t ~ges-" 
The Development Charges' that may be levied 

shaH be as per the zones defirted in column (1) 
and at the rates specified in the .relevant columns 
,(2), (3) and '(4) as shown in the Table below: 

Zones with 
specific FAR 
as per the 

ODP/COP-of 
tb"e Planning 

Rate/sq. ID. of 
~loor area in 
cas~ of cons-

truction 

Rate/sq. m. of 
land where use 

is-instituted" 
or changed 

, Rate/sq. m. of. 
total-land to be 

!'Ub-.diVided 

Area 
1---'---;;2-----;3'----'4--

2.50 and - above 
2.00 
1.80 
1.20 

1.00 and below 

Rs,2,50 
. Rs.2.oo 

RS. 1,80 . 
R~,i~20 

RS.1.oo 

RS.2.oo 
RS.2.oo 
RS. 1.80 
RS.·1.20 
RB.1.oo 

RS.2.50 
Rs, 2.00 . 
RS.l.80 
Its. 1.20 
R.i. 1.00 

use of any land within the Pla:nning Area shall be 
undertaken or carried out--., 

(a) ~ith~ut payment of Development Charges 
• as determined by the Authority; and . . 

(b) without obtaining the certifi~te of pay­
. ment thereof in the prescribedF6rm 'F". 

(2) . The person applying for paYment of Develop­
ment charges shall apply to 'the PanajiPlanning 
and Development Authority in the manner prescribed 
in Form 'C'. ' . . . 

(3) Subject to .the other provisions of the Said 
Act, before assessment of Development Charges, 
the Town Planning- Offieer must prOVide the person ' 
applying for the payment of Development Charges 
a reasonable opportunity of being heard: . 

. Provided that such opportunity should be given 

. within a period of less than 30 days from tlie date 
of applying for payment' of Development Charges. 

3) Notice to be served in case of defauIt-

(1) Any person, Who has commenced carrying 
out of any development or has carried out such 
development, or has instituted or has changed, use 
.of land without, applYing in the mann"r prescribed 
in these notifications Shall be served witlJ. a notice 
by Panaji Planning' and 'Development. Authority for 
the assessment and payment of Development 
Charges. 

(2) Upon the service of . such notice the Town 
Planning Officer shall provide the person on whom 
the notice is served. a reasonable opportunity of 
being' heard before .assessment of. development 
charges. 

4) Town Planning Officer to detel'inine Development 
Charges~ 

.' . 

(i) On an application being made under Sl. No. 
2(2) or notice being servedtmder Sl. 1Il0.3(1) and 
afte~ reasonable 0PIlort~ty ~asb~given ~or 
hearmg, the Town Plannmg OffIcer. shall .. determIne 
the Development Charges'payable iiI Accordance with . 
ra.tes fixed .imder these notifiCations. 

Col) The Town Planning Officer shalL then 
forward. his report tll thEl' AUthOrity for assessment 
pf Development Charges: . 

2) Procedure for applyIDg for~t ~ . .... . , 
;. Provided thli.t such report shall, .be fO~ded 

... (1) Subject to the other provisloruibf ful! s~d "'\\>ithJn 45 days Of application ·or servicebf notice 
Ac~ no deVe}()plnelit:in.respect l>f,ol' chllbgeOf as the case Inay" be. . ., 



42 SERIES.INa.3 

5) BePQl't of the TOWJl Plaiming Officer to be pay the assessed charges by Challan or, Demand 
considered by the Authority lmd Development . Draft payable to. the J;>anaji Planning and Dev~lop~ 
Clial-geStQ b6l1S11eSS6d. by an order - ment Authority;' '. . .. . 

. (1) Sl1bject to the other provisions of the said (2) The Panaji Planning and Development Autho-
Act, on receipt •. of the report .d~termi'1-ing the . rityshall.ackn<lwledge the receipt in.the prescribed 
assessment of Development Charges the Authority . Form 'F'; . .' 
shall asseSs the Development Charges ~y an_o~der;_'A C<lPY of ;F<lrm 'F' will be attached to the 

Provided that the Authority may by resolution 
delegate this power of assessment to a 'standing 
technical committee consisting bf not less than 3 
members. . . . . . 

(2) If the Authority feels that the Town Plann­
ing Officer has not made a proper. assessment .of 
the charges in his report the Authority may direct 
the Town Planning Officer to submit a fresh report 
in this regard. ." 

(3) If the Authority feels that the ToWn Plann- . 
jug Officer' has not afforded a reasonable opportu­
nity of being heard to the person applying for 
Developm~nt· Charges or the person served with 
notice, as: the· case may be;' the Authority may 
provide fUrther opportwiity to the aggrieved person 
. or his representative ,to. present his case.··· . 

. . :' "."'-.: .',.~. . ". .)" -.. ' '. 
(4) The order of ' assessment .shall be passed.by 

the Authority' within 60 days of application for 
assessment of Development Charges or service of 
notice as the case may be,. 

6) Befusalor postponement of AsseSsmeDt'of 
Development. Charges on certain 'grounds -

The Plaruung and Development ,Authority may 
,refUse. or postpone assessment on the following 
grounds-' .. 

(a) Where permission :under Chapter VII of the 
said Act has not been or cannot be granted 
for' carrying' out ·the·said' development, the 
Planning ·and Development Authority may 
postpone the assessment of the' Develop-

· ment. Charges; 

(b) '. Where' the application relates to' the carry­
ing . out of any development, . the Authority 
·inay ·refuse·to assess the development 
eharges payable in respect thereof, unless 
it i~ ~ati~fied that the ,applicant has ali 
interest in .the land sufficient to enable 

· him to carry out such development, or that 
the applicant will ca;rryout. such deyelop_ 
ment within such period as the Panaji 

.'r()levant ,application for. which perIilission is requi-
red' under Chaptllr VII, of the said Act. 

. 8)Appe;d and Penal Provision -:-

(1) Appeal against the -Development Charges 
assessed under this Notification shall be made as 
prescribed under section .103 of the said Aet and 
under Rule 20 (b) of the Goa, Daman and Diu Town 
andCo,JlD;try Planning (planning. and Development 
AuthoritieS) Rules, 1977. . . . 

(2) All the defaulting Development Charges 
imposed under this N ptification shall be recoverable 
as per'sectio11104 6f the said Act: .. 

D. R. Bhat, Member Secretary; 

Panaji, 15th March, 1985 . 

FO,RM 'F' 

1. Certified that Shri/Smt,/Kum,/ .. , address has paid the 
amount ' of, . Rs. ".' by Demand Draft/Challan towards 
Development Charges assessed vide Order No. ?. dated .•. , 

2. certified that the. applicant. has the amount of- ItS:' ... 
,outstan:ding aga:~st ,his/her nal!le. 

3. Certif,ied that the applicant has to' receive an amount of 
Rs. ... as refund against Deyelopm~nt Charges paid. 

The abOve paYment· relates to the Development, described . 
below: -

1) Description,'" 

2) Land bearing NOS., '" 
V. No. 408/1981> 

• 
. The Southern Planning and Development Authority 

NotifieatiOti 

· Planning.'and Development Authority con-' 

Whereas. by Notification No. 4-10-83-LAWD 
dated 5-11-1984' and published in the Official 
Gazette. No. 33. Series I, dated 15-11-1984, Govern­
ment had publishedtheGoa, Daman andDiu,Towfl 
and Country Planning (Planning and Development 
Authorities) (Fifth Amendment) 'Rules,. 1984, 
wherein the. maximum and minimum Development 
Charges that may. be levied by a Planning and 
Development Authority have been prescribed and 
also the time and manner of filing an app()al under 
section 103 of the,Goa, DalX\an and Diu,Town and 
Country Planning Act, 1974 (hereinafter called the 
said "Act"). 

siders appropriate; . 

(c) ,Where ·theapplication relates to the insti­
tution of or change of use of any .land the 
Panaji Planning and D eve lop men t 
Authority may refuse to .assess th~amount 

. of'Development Charges payable il1.resp()ct 
thereof Unless it is satisfied that the use 

. wlU be institUted witIiin such period as the 
···Pan aji . Planning arid Development 
Authoritycohside~ appropriate. 

'i~, .Mod~of. pa~t .~f ~veIOpmeJltChar-ges ,..:., ..•.. 
"-" '-- .'. , ,'/>. -." " 

Now, therefore, pursuant to section 100 of the 
said Act; and as per approval of the Government 
conveyed by Under Secretary (P.W. & U. D.) 's letter 
No,4/10/83-LA WD .dated 30-3-1985 following shall . 
be the:rates of Development <:;barges and. procedure 
for c ' applying for. Qevelopment' .. Charges, "mode' of 

.paY!)1ent of Development Charges, ~tc.: - .... 

(1) On receipt of the Order the perSonmtending .1),RIt .. tE!s. o;t'l)eyelopiileDt.Charges='.·'· 
to carry out th"l d()velopmentinrespect of orinstH .. 
tute,or'changeilse of landfor whieh. 'pennission ~) .' Tlte" Devel()pment' Charges that 'maybeleVIell 
undllr Chapter vrr of'the said Act is ,n.~es\!~rYsha1J1!l;1all,.~, as lltlt',the zones' defined'ili' colutifu(l) 

.'~.' :,,'.-0 .... ,- '.' , _ '. 



~
_l ,. 
, ' 

,18T.H APRIL, 1985 (CHAITRA 28 .. 1907) 

.and at the rates specified in the relevant columns 
(2), (3) and (4) as shown in the Table below: 

Zones with 
specific FAR 

as per the 
ODP/CDP of 
th'e Planning 

Area. 

Rate/sq., m. of 
floor area in 
case oi: cons-

truction 

1 2 

2.50 and above' .Rs. -2.50 . 
2,00 Rs. 2.00 
1.80 Rs. 1.80 
1.20 Rs.1,20 

1.00 and below Rs. 1,00 

Rate/sq. m. of Rate/sq. m; of 
land where use total land to be 

IS instituted sub-divided' 
or changed 

3 • 
Rs. 2.00 Rs.2.50' 
Rs, 2.00 Rs. 2.00 
Rs.1,80 Rs. 1.80 
Rs.1,20 Rs.1.20 
Rs. 1.00 ,Rs.1.00 

2) Procedure for applying for development c11arges-

(1) Subject to the, other provisions of the said 
,Act no development in respect of, or 'change of 
use of any land within the Planning Area shall be 
undertaken or carried out-

(a) without payment or' Development Charges 
as determined by the Authority; and 

(b) without obtaining the certificate of pay­
ment thereof in the,prescribed Form 'F' 

(2) The person applying for payment of Develop­
ment Charges shall apply to the Southern Planning 
and Development Authority in the manner prescribed 
jnForm Ie"; , 

, (3) Subject to the other provisions of the said 
Act, before assessment of 'Development Charges, 
the Town Planning Officer must provide the person 
applying for the payment of Development Charges 

,a, reasonable opportunity of being heard: 

Provided that such opportunity should be given 
within a period of less than 30 days from the date 
,of applying for payment of Development Charges. 

3) Notice to be served, in case of default-

(1) Any person, who has commenced carrying 
-out of any development or has carried out such 
,development, or has instituted or has changed use 
of land without applying in the manner prescribed 
in these notifications shall be served with a notice 
by the Planning and', Development Authority for 
the assessment and, payment of" Development 
Charges. ' 

, (2) Upon the service of such notice the Town 
Planning Officer shall provide the person on Whom 
the notice is served a reasonable opportunity of 
being heard before assessment of development, 
charges. 

4) Town Planning Officer to deternline Development 
, Charges- , 

(1) On an application being made under Sl: No. 
2(2) or notice being served under SI. No. 3(1) 'and 
afte~ reasonable opportunity has, been given for 
hearmg, the Town Planning Officer shall determine 
-the Development Charges payable in accordance with 
rates fixed under these notifications. -

, (2) The Town Planning Officer .shall then 
forward his report to the Authority for' assessment 
.of Development Charges:' -

43 

Provided that such report shall be forwarded 
within 45 days of application or service of notice 
as the case may be. 

5) Report of the Town Planning Officer to 00 
considered by the Autho'rity and Development 
Charges to be assessed by an order - ' 

(1) Subject to the other, proviSions of the .said, 
Act, on 'receipt of the report determining the 
assessment of Development Charges the AuthOrity 
shall aSsess the Development Charges by an order: 

Provided: that the Authority may by re~olution 
delegate this 'power of ass~ssment to ,a standing 
technical committee conSisting of not less than 3 
members. ' , 

(2) If the Authority feels that the Town Plannc 
ing Officer has not 'made a proper assessment of 
the charges in, his report the Authority may direct 
the Town Planning Officer to submit a fresh report 
in this regard. 

(3) If the Authority' feels that 'the Town Plann­
ing Officer has not afforded a reasonable opportu­
nity of being heard to the person applying for, 
Development Charges or the person served with 
notice, as, the case may be, the Authority may 
provide further opportunity to the aggrieved person 
or his representative to present his case. 

(4) The order of, assessment shall be passed by 
the Authority within 60 days of application for 
assessment of Development Charges or service' of 
notice as the case may be. ' 

6) Refusal or postponement of Asse~ment of 
Development, Charges on certain grounds-

,The ~lanning and Development Authority may 
refuse or postpone assessment on the following 
grounds-' , 

(a) Where ,permission under Chapter VII of the 
said Act has not been or cannot be granted 
for c8;rrying out the said development, the 
Planmng and Development Authority may 
postpone the assessment of the Develop-
mentCharges; ,,' , 

(b)~ere,theapplication relates to the carry­
mg out of any development, the Authority 
may refuse to' assess the development 
charges payable in respect thereof, unless 
it is satisfied that the applicant has an 
interest in the land sufficient to enable 
him to carry out such'development, or that 
the applicant will carry out such develop­
ment within, such period as the Southern 
Planning and Development Authority con­
siders appropriate; 

(c) Where the application relates to the insti­
tution of Or change of use of any land the 
Sou t l?- ern Planning and Development 
Authority may refuse to assess'the amount 
of Development Charges payable in respect 
thereof unless it is satisfied that the use 

, will be, instituted within such period as the' 
Southern Planning and ,D eve lop men t 
Authority, consid~rs ,appropriate. ' , ' 



44 

7) Mode of paYment of Development Charges-:-

. (1) On receipt of the order. the person inte~din!5 
to carry out the development m resp~ct of or .m~tl­
tute or change- use of land for whIch permIssIon 
under Chapter VII of. the said Act is necessary shall 
pay the assessed charges by Challan or Demand 
Draft payable to the Southern Planning and Deve· 
lopment Authority; 

(2) The Planning. and Development Authority 
shall acknowledge the receipt in the prescribed 
Fon~l 'F'; 

A copy of Form 'F' will be attached to the relevant 
application for which ~rmission is required under 
Chapter VII, of the said Act. 

8) Appeal and Penal Provision-

(1) Appeal against the Development Charges 
assessed under this Notification shall be made as 
prescribed under section 103 of the said Act and 
under Rule 20 (b) of the Goa, Daman and Diu Town 
and Country. Planning. (flanningand Development 
Authorities) Rules, 1977. 

(2) All . the defaulting Development Charges 
imposed under this Notification shall be recoverable 
as per section 104 of the said Act, 

N. Pandalai, Member Secretary. 

Margao, 6th March, 1985. 

FORM-F 

1) Name of Assessee: ........................................... ; ....... . 

(with complete Address) ....................... ; .... : ......... . 

TO BE FILLED BY AUTHORITY 

2) . Explain in short if assessee ,has sufficient interest in 
land to carry out development: . 

•.........•.•••••.........•.•••......•••..................••.................•.......•• 

........ , .............................. , ................................................ . 

SERIES I No.3 

/9) Totai leri.gth/ar~a ........ , .......... : .. ~ ....... : ......................... ". 

10) Any ot~er remarks ............................. : .................... . 

......................................................................................... -

.•.......... : .... :., .....••...•.•....................•...•......................•...... : 

DEALING HAND 

ASSESSMENT ORDER NO ................ DT ................ . 

i) Application duly made in Form 'C' and hearing completed'. 

H) Assessment ·made after service of notice and hearing" 
. completed. 

iii) Best judgement assessment made as applicant di~ not 
attend hearing. 

Developm'ent charges' payable Rs. .. ........................ . 

Iv) Assessment is refused/postponed for the following' 
reasons: 

......................... ~""""""""" ...................... : .... , .......... . 

..................................................................................... 

.......... .- ................................................................. ; .... " .... . 

.................... , ..... : ........ ,.' .. : ..... ~ ............................... , ........... -' . 

TOWN. PLANNING OFFICER 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

Receipt No ...................... dt ..................... . 

The MormugaQ Planning and Development' Authority has' 

received by' Challari/Demand Draf~ ~o ................................ . 
dated ........... ;.;.: .......... ~ towards payment 'Of Development. 

Charges .towards Order No ........ : ................... dated .......... .. 

:rhe amount of Rs-. ..................... (Rupees .... , .............. ). 

ACCOUNTANT 

REMARKS: 

.... : ............................................................ :..................... . ..................................................................................... ~ 

3) Survey No. and City/V~llage, of plot to be developed: :." 

4) Nature of Development; (strike 'o~t what is not necessary) 

i} Single Family /l\[ulti-family dwelling (ii) Commer-
, cial/Public & Semi-Public ,Building (iii) Industrial 

Building (iv) BuUding for Transport and COnununi-
. cation. ' 

v) Other buildings. (Specify) ................................... .. 

.....•••........••.•.•............•.••.•..•••..•••...............•.•..........•........ 

vi) Sub~division of land ........... :~ .............. : ............... . 

vii), Change in land/building' use (speoify) .: ................ . 

....................................................................................... 

5) Zone of Area as per ODP/CDP ................................ : .. 

~). Is the pro~)'Q~ed development as per Rules? ' 

................... , .................................................................... . 

............... , ........................ , .............................................. . 

.••..••.........•••..•...••••.•....••••.....•...••..•.....••.•........••••......•...... 

7) _Method of 'assessment (sq. mts. floor area/~q. mts of', 
land area/running metre) 'ft;:;' 

8) F. A, R . ................................................................... 

.................................. , ................................................... . 

........................................................................... 

............................................................................ 

N. E.: The assessment of development charge under' section 
, 102 of the Act does not biu..d the Authority to approve 

the. plans to'be submitted for Development PermiSSion. 

V. No. 402/1985 

• 
Mormugao Planning and Development Authority 

Notification 
. MPDA/670/ ADM/85-86/20 

Whereas' by Nofification No .. 4-10-83-J:,A WD· 
dated 5-11-1984" and published in the Official 
Gazette No. 33 Series T, dated 15-11:-1984, Govern­

,ment had published the Goa, Daman and Diu, Town 
and -Country Planning (Planning and Development .. 
Authorities) (Fifth Amendment) Rules, 1984; 
wherein ·the maximum and minimum Development. 
Charges that may be levied by a ,Planning and. 



I) 

, m 
18TH APRIL, 1985 (CHAITRA 28,1907)~._ '--_---'--'-'-"---'--'-----'-'-----'--'------'-----

Development Authority Ilav~ .h.een prescribed and 
also the time and manner of fllmg an appeal under 
section 103 of the Goa, Daman and Diu, Town and 
Country Planning Act, 1974 (hereinafter called the 
said "Act").' 

Now, therefore; pursuant to section 100 of the 
said Act· and as per approval of the Government 
conveyed by Under Secretary (P.W. & U. D.) 's letter 
No. 4/10/83-LA W:D dated 30-3-1984, following shall 
be the rates of Development Charges and procedure 
for applying for Development Charges, mode of 
payment of Development· Charges, etc.: - . 

1) Rates· of Development Charges-

The Development Charges that. may' be levied 
shall be as per the zones defined in column (1) 
and at the rates specified, in the relevant columns 
(2), (3) and (4) as shown in the Table below: 

Zones with . Rate/sq, In. of· Rate/sq. m. of Rate/sq." m. of 
specific FAR floor area in land where use total land to be 

as per the case of cona- is instituted sub-divided 
ODP/CDP of truction or ,changed 
th'e Planning 

Area 

1 2 3 4 

2.50 and ab9ve ,Rs.2.50 Rs. 2.00 Rs.2,50 
2.00 Rs.2.00 Rs. 2.00 Rs. 2.00 
1.80 Rs.1.80 Rs. 1.80 Rs. 1.80 
1.20 Rs.l.20 Rs.1.20 Rs. 1.20 

1.0.0. and below Rs.l.00 Rs. 1.00 Rs.1.00 

2) Procedure for applying for development charg~ 

(1) Subject to the other provisions of the said 
Act no development in respect of,. or change of 
use, of any land within the Mormugao Plannillg Area 
shall be undertaken or carried out---< 

(a) without payment of Development Charges 
as determined by the Authority; and 

(b) without obtaining the certificate of pay­
ment thereof. in the prescnbed Form 'F'. 

(2) The person applying for payment of Develop­
ment Charges shall apply to the Planning and Deve­
lopment Authority in the manner prescribed in 
,-Form 'C'. 

" 

the notice is serVed a reasonable' opportunity of 
being heard before assessment of development 
charges. 

. . 

4:) Town Plru:ming Officer to derei'mine Developme.nt 
Charges- . 

(1) On an application 'being made unde.r SI­
No. 2(2) or notice being serv~dunder SI.~o. 3(1) 
and ilfter reasonable opportumtyhas been gIven ~or 
hearing, the T()wu Planning Officer s~all determme 
the Development Charges. paya~l~ I~ accorda~lCe 
with rates fixed under these nobflcatlOns~ 

. (2) The Town Planning Officer . shall then 
forward his report to the Authority for assessmeot 

, of Development Charges: . 

Provided. that such report shall b~ f()rwar~ed 
within' 45 days of application or service of notice 
as the case may be. 

5) Report of the Town Planning Officer to be 
considered by the' Authority and' J)eveIoPmeot 
Charges to 00 assessed by an order-

, . . 
(l)Subject to the other provisions of. ~he said 

Act on receipt of the report determmmg the 
ass~ssment of Development Charges the Authority 
shall assess the Development Charges by an order: 

Provided that the Authority may by resolution 
delegate this power. of . assessment. to a standing' 
technical 'committee consistillg of ,not less than 3 
members. 

(2) If .the Authority feels that the Town Plann­
ing Officer has .not made a proper .assessmen.t of 
the charges in hiS report the AuthOrity may direct 
the Town Planning Officer to submit a'fre.Sh report 
in this regard. 

(3) If the Authority feels that the TOWnPlann­
ing Officer has not afforded a reasollable opportu­
nity of being heard to the persoll applying for 
Development Cha:ges or the person served with 
notice,as the case maybe, the Authority m/ty 
provide furthero!>portunity to the aggrieved person 
or his representative, to present his case. 

(3) . Subject to the other provisions of the said. 

(4) Tile order of .. assessment shall be passed by, 
the Authority within 60 days of application· for 

'assessment of Development Charges or service of 
notice as the case may be. 

Act, before assessment of Development Charges, 
the Town Planriing Officer must provide the person 
applying for the payment ,of Development Charges 
a reasonable opportunity' of being heard: 

Provided that such opportunity should be given 
within a period of less than 30 days from the. date 
of applying for paynient of Development Charges. 

3) Notice to be served 'in. case of dllfault-

(1), Any person, who has commenced carrying 
out of any development or has carried Qut such 
development, or has instituted or has changed use· 
of land without applyiiig in the manner prescribed 
in these notifications shall be serVed with a notice 
by the Planning and Development Authority for the' 
assessment and payment of Development Charges •. " 
.' .. '.0 

(2) Upon the service of 'such notice the Town 
R.lann.ing Qfficer shall, provide. the person . on' whom 

6) Refusal or postponement of 'Assessment .of 
Development Charges onJ certain grounds-

The Planning and Development Authority may 
refuse or postpone aSsessment. 011 the following 
grounds.~' 

(a) Where permission under Chapter VII of the 
said Act has not been or cannot be granted 
for carrying out the said development, the 
Planning and Development Authority may 
postpone the assessnient of the Develop­
ment Charges; 

(b) Where the application relates to the carry­
ing out of any development, the Authority 
may refuse to assess the development 
charges. payable in respect thereof, Ullless 
it is satisfied that the applicant has an 



46 

interest. in the land sufficient to enable 
·him to carry out such development, or that 
the applicant will carry out such develop­
ment, within such peridd as the Planning 
and Development A 11 tho r i t Y considers 
appropriate; 

(c) Where the application relates to the insti­
tutionof or change of use of anyland the 

.. Planning· and .Development AuthOrity may 
refuse to assess the amount of Development 
Charges payable in respect thereof unleSS 
it is satisfied that the use will be instituted 
within such period as the Planning ana 
Development .. Authority considers appro­

. priate. 

'7) Mode of payment of Development Charges-

(1) On receipt of the order the person intending 
to carry out the development in respect of or institute 
or change use of land for which permission under 
Chapter VII of the said Act is necessary shall pay 
the assessed .charges by Challan or Demand Draft 
payable to the Mormugao Planning and Development 

. Authority. . 

(2)" The Mormugao Planning and Development 
Authoritysliall acknowledge the receipt in. the pres­
cribed Form .'F'. 

. A COpy of Form 'F' will be a.ttached to the relevant 
application for which permission is required under 
Chapter VII, of the said Act. 

8) Appeal and Penal Provision-

(i) Appeal'agairtst . the Development . Charg~s 
assessed under· this Notification sha11 be made as 
prescribed under. section 103 of the said' Act and 
Under Rule 20 (b) of the Goa, Daman and Diu Town 
and COUI\try Planning (Planning and Development 
Authorities) Rules, 1977. 

.(2) All the defaulting Development· Charges . 
Imposed under this Notification shall be recoverable 
as per section ·104 of the said Act .. 

.T~ Ne()gy, Member Secretary. 
, . 'I 

Mormugao, 4th April, 1985. 

FORM-9 
(See .RuIe 20) 

. Form of application for the a~sessment 
of Development Charges 

"The Goa, Daman and Diu Town and Country Planning A.~t,.1974 

(Act 21 of 1975) 

To," 

••.•• ••••• -••• i •••••.. 

Sir, 

SERIES I No. 3 

1) Nature· of Development:-

2) Location:,-

·Date· .......... · .. . 

Signature of owner 

Address: 

Note: The 'FO~~ 'e' should',be accomparu.ed by the folloWing 
documents: ' 

1) The ownership or right or !nterest in land sufficient 
to enable ,the applicant' to carry out ~he" intended 
development - supported by ·the following documents 
(wherever applicable); 

a) Certified ~opy, of the plan: of the land, from the 
Dir.ectq.rate of Land Survey. 

b) Index of Land in Form III, I & XIV or, City 
Survey Register. . 

c) Sale/Gift/Lease/Mortgage ,and Dr any other ins~ 
trument of assignment. . 

2) pians of' the proposed development showing: 

a) A complete site- _plan ,@ scale of not less than 
1:500. 

b) Detailed -Statement of areas, coverage, setbacks, 
. F. A. R.' permissible & consumed, open spaces, 

length ot roads- and drains (if any), compound 
"walls and gates and any other type of development· 
(including changes of use ''Of land" or sub-division' 
of land). . 

c) Date of com'mencement of construction. 

. d) 'Any other rel,evant document or plan. 

3) All document~ sh'Ould 'be signed by the person' holding 
sufficient interest· in" .,the land to carry out the 

. -intended development. 

N. B. - The assessment of development charge under 
. . Section 102 of the Act does not bind the Authority 

to approve the'-plans to_be submitted for development 
permission. 

Town Planning Offi~er' 

FORM-F 

lr Name of Assessee: .................... _ .... _ .......................... . 

(with complete Addre~s) ............... ; ...................... . 

TO BE FILLED BY AUTHORITY 

2) Explain in short if.,·assessee -has -sufficient interest. in 
land to carrY out developmen~: ' 

. ........................................................... '" ......................... . 

.. ................................................................................... .. 

....................................................................................... 
3) Survey No. and CityjVillage, ,of plot to be developed: ... 

4)· Nature of Development (strike 'Out what is not necessary) 

i) Single Family!Multi·family dwelling (H) Commer~ 
cial/Public & Semi-Public BuUding (iii) Industrial 
BulIding .(iv) Building for. Transport and Commur..i ... -, 
cation. 

v) Other buildings (Specify) ............... ~ ................... : 

.................... H ....... ~ ••••••••••••••• ' .... : ................................... .. 

. vi) Sub·4ivision of land· .. ··· ...... ·· ..... ·, .. ~ ........... _ ... I .... .. 

vii) Change in hind/building use (specify) .................. . 

. ...................................................................................... . 
. 5).Zone Of Area as per ODP/CDP · ... : ............•....... c .. : ..... 

': 6} Is. the proposed d~ve16pinent as per Rules'? 
I h'erehy give 'notice,urider sub~section (1) of-Section 102 

of the' Act that I intend to carry out/l :am carry,in,g -out/! " _:_<",: .... -............ ~ .................... -................................. -.............. , 
have carJ;"led out development mentioned "below and request *;:,.~: ...... : ....................................................... ~ ..................... :. 
you to asses~ the development charge, if any; payable in~' " . 
re.spect thereof under Section ~OO, _<>f the Act. ............................ : ............ ; ............. :., ............... ' ................. .. 



Ad·· 
1 

18TH 4PRIL,1985 (OHAITRA 28,190"1) 

7) Method of assessment (sq. m~s.. ~oor a~a/sq.,· mts of 
lan~ area/running metre) ,_" . , 

. 8) F. A. R. ................•...........•...................................... 

9) Total length/area ... : ......... : ........................ ; .............. . 
10): Any other remarks ...................... _ ................... ~ ........ . 

................ -... ; ................................ , ..................... -' ... ~ .. ~ . . . .. , 

••.....•..•.....•••..........••........... ! •...•...• ~ .....••.•.•...•••••••••...•••••••• 

DEALING HAND 

ASSESSMENT ORDER NO •.•............. DT ....... : ........ 

i) Application ·dUlymade in Form 'C' and heariitg-completed. 
ii) Assessment made after service of n'Otice and hea~'i~ 

completed. ' < 

-
iii). Best judgement -assessment. made as applicant .9.id not 

attend hearing. -. . 

Developmen~ charges payabl~. Rs. .', .. , ...... -.. > .. : .••• ; .• ' •• :. 
( Rupees ............ : ..... ). 

iv) "Xssessinent is '-refli-sed/postponed for ,the ,.follo.wing 
reasons: 

...................... -.-.-:._ ........ : . .-., ............. ' ...... ' .... _ ............. : ........... ,' .. . 

........................................................ ~ •••••• , •••••• , ••••••• M ......... . 

... : ................. -.............................. -................................. . 

TOWN PLANNING OFFI:CER 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

Receipt No ..................... :dt. ................ ,.,'; 

The Mormugao Planning and Deve:lopment Authority' has 

received by Chal1an/Demand _Draft No .............................. _.: 

dated ......................... ,. towards payment 'of -Development 

Charges towards Order No.; ........................ dated ... " ...... :.: 

The amount of Rs ........... : .......... '(Rupees .................. ) 

ACCOUNTANT 
REMARKS: 

•.....•... -.•........••...•.....••........••.............•..........••...•.....•...... . . 
....••.••.......•......••..•.....•.........••..................•...•.....•. ~ .......... . 
........•.... , •.......•• , ........... ',' ~l .• ·· ..•. ; .... ' ..... :: •...•...•....•....••..••.......• 

......•............•.......••• ..••...•..•.••.....•.•..........•.... -•...••..•...... , ... 
• ' ": -"".' - " "-" - "', --, . "'. ~ I ; 

N. E.:.' The assessment of' development charge _under section 
102 ·of the Act does not bind the Autho.rity to approve 
,the plans to be submitted for Dev,elopn:ent Permission. 

V.' No. 387/1985 

.'" 
Tourism, Information andT ransport f)e~~rtment 

Notification 

47 

mationof all persons likely to 00' affected thereby 
and notice is hereby given that the llald' draft; rules 
will be taken into consideration by the Go,vernment 
on or after the expiry of thirty days froin the date 
of ,publication of this notification in the Official 
Gazette. . 

2. All objections and suggestion to the said draft 
rilles may be forwarded to the Uilder Secretary to 
the Government of Goa, Daman and Diu, Tourism, 
Information & Transport Department, Secretariat, 
Panaji, Goa, within fifteen days from the date of 
publication of this notification in· the Official . 
Gazette .. 

DRAFT RULES. 
In exercise· of the powers conferred by section 21, 

section 21J, section 41 and section 68 of the Motor 
Vehicles Act, 1939 (Central Act 4 of 1939) and all 
other powers enabling him in that behalf, the Admi­
riistrator of Goa, Daman and Diu hereby makes the 
following rules, to further amend the Goa, Daman 
and Diu Motor Vehicles Rules, 1965, namely:-

1. Short .title and cOnmlencement. - (1) These 
rules may 00 called the Goa, Daman and Diu Motor. 
Vehi~les (Amendment) Rules, 1985 . 

(2) They shall come into force·at once. 

2. i\mendmentof rule 2.2. - In clause (viii) of 
rule 2.2 of the Goa, Daman and Diu Motor Vehicles 

. Rules, 1965 (hereinafter called the "Principal rules"), 
for the words "two rupees", the words "five rupees" 
shall be substituted: 

3. Amendment of'rule 2.3.:.... In clause (iii) of nile 
2.3 of the principal rules, for the words "five rupees", 
the words "teh rupees" shall 00 substituted. 

4. Amendment of rule 2.7.-In clause (vi) of rule 
2.7 of the principal rules, for the. words "five rupees", 
the words "twenty rupees", shall be SUbstituted. ., 

. 5. Amendment of rule 2.8: "-In clause (ivlof rule 
2;8 of the principal rules, for the words "five rupees", 
.the words "twenty rupees", shall be substituted. 

6. Amendment of ride 2.9. - In clause (iv) of rule 
2.9 of the. principal rules, for the words "five rupees", 
the words "twenty rupees", shall 00 substituted.' 

7. Amlmdment of rule 2.13. - In Clause (ll) of rule 
2.13 of the principal rules, for the words "three 
rupees", the words "five rupees" shan. be substituted . 

8. Amendment of rule 3.10.-In sub-rule (3) 6f~ule 
3.10 of the principal rules,for the words "two 
rupees", the words "five rupees" shall be substituted: 

. 9. Amendment of rUie3.n.-2In sub-rule (4) of 
rule 3.11 of the principal rules, for the words "ten 
rupees", the words "twenty rupees" shall be substi-
tutl"d.. . '. ... ..... 

10. Amendment of rule 3.14.:"" In sub-rule ('1) of 
rule '3.14 ·of the' principal rules, for the words "five 
rupees", ,the. words "one hundred rupees" shall 00 . 
SUbstituted. . •. 

'. h •.. :, .. 4/36/st-HB (G)., .y 

.: The1;ollo~htgfu.ait ~f ce~ain rules'filltIi~r'to 11. Amendment of rule 3.15.-In sub-rule (2) of 
amend th~ Goa, Daman and Pi~J\lIf>torY ehicleli' Rules, rule 3.15 of the principal rules, for the worm: "five 
1965, WhICh the Government of' Goa/Daman' aiid·Diu. rupees, the words "ten rupees" shall be substituted. 
proposes to makeynder sections 21, 21J, 4l.and 68 .... 12. Amendment of rille 3.16.-In SUb-rule (2) of 
of the Motor Vehicles .Act, 1939. (C~ntralAct 46~:' rule.3,lUof the prinCipal rules, for the bracket and 
1?39) are here?y published as reqUlJ'ed bysul:I;sil/!'J:;··' thew6tds" (five) rupees" the word "t nt " 
tion (1) ofsectron 133 of the said Act, for the·info;::'·· .. Shaiioosubstituted. '. s we y rupees 



';i , 
:l 

48 

13.Amen~ent of rule 3.19. - In rule 3.19 of. the 
principal ,rules -

,(a) in sub'rule (1),-
(i) bJ.clause (a),for the words "Twelve I'll" 

pees", the words "Twenty. rupees" shall be 
substituted; , " 

(ii) in Clause (b) .. for the words "Eighteen 
1'1,Ipees", the' words "Thirty. rupees': shall be 
SUbstituted;' . . , 

, ,(iii) in clause (c), for the words_"Thirty. six, 
rupees", the words "Fifty. rup~es" shall be subs-
tituted; . , 

(iv) inclause (d), for the words "Five rupees"; 
the words "'1'en rupees" ShaiI be substituted. ' 

(b) in sub"rule (2), forthe ,words "two 'rupees'" 
the words "Ten rupees" shall be ,substituted', 

14, Amendment ()f l.'ule 3;21. - In sub-rule (6) of 
rule 3.21 of the principal ruies-

'(1) for the words "a swh of ,ten ruPees", the 
words, "a SUlU of twenty. rupees" shall be subs­
tituted; ", '. , 

(ii) for the words, "No fee shall, be payable", 
the words "A fee of rupees ten shall be pay.able" 
shall pe substituted; , 

(iii) for the words "a, further fee of rupees two", 
the 'Words "a further fee of rupees' ten" shall he 
substituted. . 

, ' ' 

15. Amendment of rule 3.26. ~ In sub-rule (3) of 
rule 3:26 of the principal l.'ules, for the words "one 
hundred rupees" and "fifty. rupees" ,the words, "two 
hundred' and fifty. rupees" and "one hundre!l and 
twenty. five ruPees" respectively. shall be SUbstituted. 

16. Amendment of rule4.14 . ....:In rule 4.14 of the 
principal l.'ules"": ' , 

(i) in SUb-rule (1)" for the word's "twenty. ru­
pees", ,and· "five rupees'.', '.the words.~'forty.r'ijpee~~' 
'and '''ten 'rupees" respectively. shall be substituted; 

(li) in sub-rule (2), 'for the wordS "five rupees" 
the words "ten rupees" shall he substituted. 

17. Amendment ()f rule 4;25.-In sub-rule (2) of 
rule 4.25 of the principal rules, for the words "five 
rupees", the words "twenty. five rupees" shall be' 
substituted.., ' 

18. Amendment of rule 4.28. -.- In sub-rule (4) of 
rule 4.28 of the principal rules, for the words "No 
fee shall he chargeable", the words "l\..' fee of rupees 
twenty. shall be, chargeable" shall he substituted. 

19. Amendment of rule 4.31 • ....: In rule 4.31 of the 
principal rules, for the words "five rupees", the 
words "ten rupees" shall be substituted. 

20. Amendment of l.'ule 4.33. - In sub-rule (5) of 
rule 4.33 of the prinCipal rules, fpr the words "five 
rupees", the words "teu rupees" shall he substituted. 

21. Amendment ()f rule 4.36. ~:rn. rule 4.36' of the 
prinCipal rules - . 

(i) in sub-rule (3), for the. word's "tw~nty. ru­
Pees", the words "fifty rupees" ,shall besubstitute,d. 

, ," , ...... ' 

'(ii) in sub-rule (4), for the 'words "fifty. paise" 
the words "five rupees" sliall 'be SUbstituted. 

22. Amendment of rule 4.47. - In the proviso to 
sub-rule ,(10) of rule 4.47 of the principal rules, for 
the words "one rupee" , the Words "ten rupees" shall 
be substituted. 

"23. Amendment o:l'l.'ule 4.47 B. -In sub-rule (4) -
of ,rule 4.47 B of the principal rules, for the words 
"fifty. paise", tl,1e words "five rupees"shall be subs­
tituted. 

24 .. Amendment ,of ,rule 4.48 .. ~ In. sub-rule (3). of 
rule 4.48 of the principal rilles, for the words "three 
rupees", the words "ten rupees" shall be substituted.' 

.. 25. Amendment of l.'ule4.49. - In sub-rule (3)' of 
rule 4.49 of the principal rules, for the words "three 
rupees", the words "ten rupees" shall he substituted. , 

By. order and in the mime of the· Lieutenant 
Governor- of Goa, Daman and Diu. 

S. D. Sailhale, UnderSecretary. (STE). 

Panaji, 9th Apr1I, 1985: 

••• 
Industries and labour Department 

Notification 
25/3/85-ILD 

Whereas the Government of Goa,' Daman and 
Diu, with the appr.oval of the Central Government, 
intends to apply. all the provisions of the Maternity. 

, Benefit Act,1OOl (Central Act 53 of 1961) to the 
following classes of establishments, namely.:-

i) Local bodies; 
ii) Farms organised on a commercial scale; 
iii) Hospitals and other medical institutions; 
iv) ,Administrative offices of factories, mines 

which are covered under the' ~ct; and 
v) Trading and commercial establishments 

such as banks (including cooperative 
banks). 

Now, Therefore, in exercise of the powers con-' 
ferred by. the proviso to sub-section (1) of section 2 
of the said Act, ,the Goverwuent of' Goa; Daman 
and Diu hereby. gives two months' . notice of its 
intention to apply. all the provisions of the said Act 
to the classes of establishments specified above. 

Any. suggestions or objections may. be forwarded 
to the Secretary., Industries and Labour Department, 
Secretarjat, Panaji-Goa, within a 'period of two 
months from the date of pUblication of this Noti" 
fication, in . the Official GQzette; 

By. order and in the'name of the Administrator 
of Goa, Daman and Diu: 

SubOO8h V. Elekair, Uuder Secretary. (Industries 
and Labour). ',' ' 

Paiili.ji; €ith April; 11)85, 


