st

REGD. GOA -3

Panaii, 18th April, 1985 [Chaitra 26,1900 . -

ST SERIES 1Mo, 3

GOVERNMENT OF GOA, DAMAN AND DIU

 GOVERNMENT OF GOA, DAMAN
o ~ AND DU,
 Public W_'drks and - Urban 'Defeiabrﬁent_r D'eiiiriméht
Panaji Planning and Development ARuthority
Notaf:catmn

Whereas by Notificatiori - No. 4-10-83-LAWD

dated 5-11-1984 and published in- the' Official .

Gazette No. 33 Series I, dated 15-11-1984, Govern-

ment had published the Goa, Daman and Diu, Town -

and Country Planning (Planning. and Development
Authorities) (Fifth Amendment) Rules, 1984,
wherein the maximum and minimum Development
Charges that may be levied by a Planning and
Development Authority have been prescribed and
also the time and mannsr of filing an appeal under
section 103 of the Goa, Daman and Diu, Town and

Country Planning Act, 1974 (hereinafter called the '

Said “Act”) ..

Now, thérefore; pursuant- to section 100 of the.

. said ‘Act, and as per approval of the Government
conveyed by Under Secretary (P.W. & U. D.)’s'letter
No. 4/10/83-LAWD dated 30-3-1985 following shall
be the rates of Development Charges and procedure

for applying for Development Charges, mode of °

payment of Development Charges, ete.: -,
" 1) Rates of Dévcgmpmeqt Charges — o
"The Development Charges that may be levied

shall be as per the zones defined in column: (1)

and at the rates specified in the relevant columns
(2), (3) and (4) as shown in the Table below:

Zones with Rate/sq, m. of  Rate/sq, m. of . Rate/sq. m, of
specific FAR . floor area in lajid wheére use = total land to be
.as per the case of cons-. . izinstitited - sub-divided

CQDE/CDP of truction - or changed ’
the Planning - ' e ' : - '
Area N .
1. _ 2 3 7 4
250 and above  Rs: 250  Rs. 2.00 Rs. 250 .
200 © . 'Rs. 200 Rs. 2,00 Rs. 200
. 180 " Rs. 1.80 Rg. 1.80 Rs. 1.80
120 . Rs.lZo Rs. 1.20 Rs. 1.20
. 100 and below - 'Rs. 100 . ° Re. 1.00 . Rs, 100

- (1) Subject to the other provisions of ihe said

Act no development.in. respect of; or change of

use of any land within"'_tﬁe Planning Area. shall be
undertakep or carried out— - _ o
o (a) withc;ut ‘payment of Development Ghargeé
., as’determined by the Authority; and - 7.
" (b) without obtaining the cértificate” of pay-
7+ ment thereof in the preseribed Form ‘F.
. (2) The peréch applying fdr‘ pament of Develop- -
ment charges shall apply te the Panaji’ Planning
and Development Authority it the manner prescribed
(3) Subject to the othér provisions of ‘the said
Act, before assessment of Development Charges, -
the Town Planning Officer must provide the person .
applying for the payment of Development Charges
a reasonable opportunity of being__hea.rd_: L

" Provided that such opportimity should be given -
. within a period of less than 30 days from the date

of applying for pa.yment-o'f.rDevek_)pment Charges.
3) Notice to be served in case of default—

(1) - Any person, who has ‘commerniced carrying
out of any development or has carried out such
development, or has instituted or has changed use
of land without applying in the manner prescribed
in these notifications shall. be. served with a notice
by Panaji Planning and Devélopment Authority for
the assessment and payment of Development

-~ Charges.

(2) Upon the service of such notice the Town
Planning Officer shall provide the person on whom
the notice is served a reasonable opportunity of
being < heard before assessment of. development

charges. o

~ 4) Town Planning Officer to determine Development

- Charges ~— = S .

(1) On-an application being made under Sl No.
2(2) or notice being served under Sl No.:3(1) and
after reasonable opportunity has been given for
hearing, the Town Planning Officer shali determine
the Development Charges payable in.accordance with
rates fixed under these notifications, -

(2) The Town Planning Officer shall - then
forward his veport to the' Authority for asSessment
of Development Charges: . . . = . =0 0

 Provided that such report shall be forwarded
within 45 days of application .or service of notice.
as the case may bs. = - . '




. ‘tute.or- ‘change use of land. for . which.. perxmssxon -
" under Chapter VII of the’ sa,ld Aet 1s necessary -shall -

4

SERIES I .No 3

5) B«eport of t.he Town Plannmg Officer to be
considered by the Authority and Development
Ohargestobeasswsedbyamorder-— :

Prowded that the Authonty may by ‘resclhution
delegate this power of assessment to a standmg
technical comm:ttee consmtmg of not less than 3
members. :

(2) If the’ Authonty feels that the Town Plann— A'

ing Officer has not made a proper sssessment .of
the charges in his report the Authority may direct

the Town Planning Offlcer to submlt a fresh report'

‘m this regard.

ing Officer has not afforded a réasonable opportu-
nity of being heard to the person -applying for
‘Development - Charges or . the person :served. with

notice, .as -the- case may be, the Authorlty may -
. prowde further opportunity to the a.ggneved person _

or ‘his representa,twe to present h1s ease.”

‘ (4) The ord.er of assessznent shall be passed by
the Authority ‘within 60 days of apphcatlon for
‘assessment of Development Charges or service of
notice a8 the case may be. .

6) Refusal ‘or. Wmmnt of Assessment of -

Development. Gharges on eerfain groumls —_

The Plamung and Development Authorlty ma.y

refuse_ or postpone asseSSment on the followmg
: grounds — ‘ oo

(a) Where permlssmn under Chapter VII of the

" said Act has not been or cannot be granted -

. for carrying out the said development, the
. Planning -and Development Authority may

" 'postpone the assessment of the’, Develop-

ment, Charges

: 7 "'(.b) '-Where the’ apphcatxon relates bo the carry-

inig out of any development ‘the Authority
© :lvomay refuse‘to assess the development
o eharges payable in respect thereof, unless

o it is satisfied thaf the applicant has an

~ interest in tHe land sufficient to enable . ment had published the Goa, Daman and Diu, Town

and Country Planning (Planmng and Development

‘him to earry out such development or that
" the applicant will carry out such -develop-
" ment within such period as the Panaji

"‘i'.PIanmng and DeveIOpment Authority con--

- siders. appropriate;

o) ~Where,the,.a.pphcatloh relates to the insti-
' tution of or change of use of auy land the
Panaji Planning and Development

- Authority may refuse to assess the amount

" of Development Charges paysble in respect

‘thereof unless it is satisfied that the use
© - will ‘be instituted within such period as the
covtPgagic
Authorlty cons:ders a.pproprlate

'7) Mode of payment of Development Oharges—;;..

(1) On reeelpt of the Ordér the pérson’ mtendmg '

to carry out the development in respect of or. insti

 dated 5-11-1984- and published

Planning ‘and Development

1

pay the a,ssessed charges by Cha.llan or, Demand

. Draft payable to, the Pana.;n Pla,nnme and Develop—
i ment Authority;

(1) Subject to the other provisions of the sazd‘ o
Act, on. receipt..of - the -report determining the
assessment of Development- Charges the Authonty_
shall assess the Development Charges by an order. L

(2) The Panaji Plannmg and DeveIOpment Autho—,

__ rity shall aeknowledge the reeelpt m the prescrlbed
‘Form ‘F’ X

A copy of Form ‘Fowill be a.ttached to the

";'E'Q",relevant “application’ for which permission is regui-
- . red’under Chapter VII, of the said Act.

. 8) Appeal and Penal Provision —

© (1) Appea.l against ‘the’ Development Charges
assessed under this Notification shall be made as
prescribed under section 103. of the said Act and

under Rule 20 (b) of the Goa,; Daman and Diu Town
and Coun,

(2) All the defaultmg Development Charges
imposed under this Notification shall be recoverable
as per:section’ 104 of the said Act

D.R. Bﬁat Member Secretary.r
Pa.na;jl 15th March 1985 .

FORM

1. Certified ‘that Shri/smt. /Rum./ . ... address has paid the.
amount “of Rs. .... by Demand Draft/Challan towards
- . Development Cha.rges assessed vide Order No. ,.. dated ..

2. Certified that the applicant - has the amou.nt of. Rs.
. outstanding agemst ‘his/her name.

3. Certified that the applicant has to° reeewe an amount of ’

‘Rs. ... as refund against Development Charges paid.

" The a,bove pa.yment re]ates to. the Development desembed :
below: - .

1) Descnptmn_ ,Q .o

2) Lénd bearing Nos. ... o o
- V. No. 408/1585

il
-

_The Southern '_Plc.r'hning; cmd Development Authority

[ N—

Not:fsoatnon

Whereas by Notification - No. 4-10-83-LAWD

in : the Official
Gazette No. 33 Series.I; dated 15-11-1984, Govern-:

Authorities) (Fifth’ Amendment) - Rules, 1984,
wherein the. maximum and minimuam Development

‘Charges .that may be levied by a Planning and

Development Authority have been prescribed and
also the time and manner of filing an appeal under.
séetion 103 of the.(Goa, Daman and Diu, Town and

Country Planning ‘Act, 1974 (hereinafter called the
said “Act”).

: Now, therefore; - pursuant to ‘section 100 of the
said Act, and as per approval of the Government ,
conveyed by Under Secretary (P.W. & U. D.)'s"letter
No. 4/10/83-LAWD dated 30-3-1985 following shall .
be the rates of Development Charges and procedure
for - applymg for- Development .Charges,” ode® of B

“payment of Development Charges, etc —n

1) Rates- of . Development Chargesm o

.. The; Development- Charges that may be Iev1ed
sl}a.ll be:as: per: the- zones- defined: in’ column * (1)

try- Planning (Plannmg and DeveIOpment ’
~ *Authorities) Rules, 1977, '
(3) If the Authority feels that the 'I‘ovm Plann-_- :




i

43

18TH APRIL, 1985 (CHAITRA 28, 1907) -

. .and at the rates specified in the relevant columns

(2), (3) and (4) as shown in the Table below:

Fate/sq. m of

Zones with Rate/sq. m. of . Rate/sq. o of
ifi ’ i land wheére uge  total land to be
Sﬁcgﬁ E‘TﬁR (f:;c;(;ro%rgg.nxsrl %g inv;tituted sub-divided
ODP/CDF of truction or changed
the Planning ' .
Area,
1 ' 2 3 4
250 and above . Rs. 2.50. - Re 200 - Rs 250
2.00 g Rs. 2.00 Rs. 2.00 . Rs.‘ 2.00
1.80 " Rs. 180 = Rs. 186 - Rs. 1.80
' 1.20 - . Rs.120 Rs. 120 - Rs. 1.20

"1.00 and below Rs. 1.00- . Rs. 1.00 : \Rst 1.00-

2) Procedure for applying for developmél_lt qhgfgase
(1) Subject to the other provisions of the said

Act no development in respect of, or change of

use of any land within the Planning Area shall be

. undertaken or carried out —

(a) without payment of Development Charges

- as determined by the Authority; and

(b) without obtaining the certificate of pay-
. ment thereof in the prescribed Form T’

(2) The perso-n'_applying for payment of Develop-

- ment Charges shall apply to the Southern Planning
and Development Authority in the manner prescribed

Ain Form ‘C*,-

3) Subj_ecf to the other provisions of the said

" Act; before ‘assessment of “Development ‘Charges,

the Town Planning Officer must provide the person
applying for the payment of Development Charges

.&. reasonable opportunity of being heard:

Provided that such opportunity should be given
-within g period of less than 30 days from the date

~of applying for payment of Deve]npmgnt-’ Charges.

3) Notice to be served in case of default—

(1) Any person, who has ‘commenced .,cari'ying '
-out of any development or has carried out such -
-development, or has instituted or has changed use

of land without applying in the manner prescribed

‘in these notifications shall be served with a notice

by the Planning and' Development Authority for
the assessment and .payment of ~ Development
Charges. . -

' {2) Upon the service of such notice the Town

-Planning Officer shall provide the person on whom
the notice is served a reasonable opportunity of

‘being " heard before assessment of development:

-charges. _ _ _
4) Town Planning Officer to determine Development
Charges — x -

(1) On an application being made under SL. No.
2(2) or notice being served under Sl No. 3(1) and

‘after reasonable opportunity. has been given  for

hearing, the Town Planning Officer shall determine

‘the Development Charges payable in accordance with -

rates fixed under these notifications.

(2) The Town Planning Officer shall then

forward his report to the Authority for assessment
-of Development Charges: =~ = . : :

Provided that such report shall be forwarded.

"~ within 45 days of application or service of notice

as the case may be. N
5) Report of the Town Plamning Officer to be
considered by the Authority and Development
~ Charges to be assessed by an order — - ‘

?(1) Subject to the "other ‘provisi'ons' of the said.

~ Act, on Teceipt of the report determining the

assessment of Development Charges the Authority
shall asseéss the ‘Development Charges by an order:

' Provided that thé Authority may by resolution

- delegate this 'power of assessment to a standing
- technical ‘committee consisting of not less than 3
" members. | ' Lo o ‘

(2) If the ‘Authority feels that the Town Plann-
ing Officer has not-'made a proper assessment of
the charges in.his report the Authority may direct
the Town Planning Officer to submit a fresh report
in this regard., - . :

- (3) If the Authority feels that the Town Plann-
ing Officer has not afforded a reasonable opportu-
nity of being heard to the person applying for .
Development Charges or the person served with
notice, as-the ‘case may be, the Authority may
provide further opportunity to the aggrieved person

- or his representative to present his case.

. (4) The order of assessment shall be passed by
the Authority within 60 days of applicatior for
assessment of Development Charges or service: of
notice as the case may be. :

6) Refusal or pdsfponement of Assessment of
' l)evelopm;ent. Charges on certain grounds —

. The E_’l-anni_ng' and Development Authority may
refuse or postpone assessment on the following

grounds —

(&) Where permission under Chapter VII of the
" said Act has not been or cannot be granted
for carrying out the said developient, the
Planning and Development Authority may
postpone the assessment of the Develop-

- ment Charges; - -

- (b) ‘Where the application relates to the carry-
.. .ing out of any development, the Authority
may refuse to assess the development
charges payable in respect thereof, unless
it is satisfied that the applicant has an
interest .in the land sufficient to enable
~ him to carry out such development, or that -
the applicant will carry out such develop-
‘ment within. such period as the Southern
‘Planning and Development Authority con-
siders appropriate; '

(c) Where the application relatés to the insh-
‘tution of or change of use of any land the
.Southern Planning and ‘Development

_Authority may refuse to assess the amount.

+ of Development Charges payable in respect

‘thereof unless it is satisfied that the use

- will be instituted within such period as the’

Southern Planning and Develo pment
Authority considers appropriate. :




’

4%

+

td Mode of payment of Development Gherges-'-:-__ :

(1) On receipt of the order the person intending-
to’ carry out the development in respect of or insti-
tute or change use of land for which permission

under Chapter VII of the said Act is necessary shall
pay the assessed charges by Challan. or Demand

Draft payable to the Southern Plan.nmg and Deve- :

lopment Authority;

(2) The Planning. and Development Authonty '

shall acknowledge the recelpt in the presenbed
Form ‘F’; :

" A copy of Form “F will be attached to the rélevant
application for which permission is required under;

Chapter VII of the said Act.

8) Appeal and Penal Provision —. | E
(1) Appeal against _the ‘Development Charg’ée

. asgessed under this Notification shall be made as
prescribed under section 103 of the said Act and

under Rule 20 (b) of the Goa, Daman and Diu Town
and Country Planning’ (Planning and Development
Anthorities) Rules, 1977T.

(2) All the defaulting Development Charges
imposed under this Notification shall be recoverable
as per section 104 of the said Act.

N. Pa’ndalm, Member Secretary.‘
Margao, 6th March, 1985.

" FORM—F .
1) NAME Of ASSOSSERL wvovrrerreeerseeoeeeeeesesesesiesssenn, e
(with complete AdGIess) ....eeesireusirerseiesiiiini,
TO BE FILLED BY AUTHORITY

_2)-Exp1a.m in short if assessee has sufflment mterest in
" land to carry out development:

3) Survey No. and Cs.ty/vlllage, of plot to be developed

i) Single Famlly/Mqu-famﬂy dwelling (ii) Commer-
cial/Public & Semi-Public Building (iii) Industrial
Bailding . (iv) Buildmg for Transport and Communi-
- cation,

v) Other buildings (SPecify) .oovoveviiriviiierriresieeeeeaens,

R R R A L R L L L PR L T L T e
....................

T) .Method of- assessment (sq mts. ﬂoor area/sq. mts of
land area/runmng metre) .

Nature of Development (strlke out what is not necessary)

SERIES I No. 8

“9) Total length/area

10) Any other Ijerna.ﬂ{e_

ASSESSMENT ORDER NO.

1) Apphcatxon duly made in Form ‘Cand hearmg completed

_n) Agsessment -made after service of notxee a.nd hearing:
completed.

iii) Best judgement assessment made as applicant did not
attend hearing.

Developrent eharges payable Rs.

iv) Assessment
reasons:

is .refused/postponed for -the  following~

TOWN PLANNING OFFICER
- .ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
' Receipt No. i, dt. '

The Mormueao Planning and Development Authomty has:
received by Cha.lla,n/Demand Draft No

dated ...........ivic. . towards payment of Development.
Charges towards Order No dated ............
The amount of Rs: (Eupees .................. )

’,,_\ 7 ) " - .
\/_ / o . ACCOUNTANT

REMARKS:

" N. B.: Thé assessment of development charge under section

© 102 of the Act does not bind the Authority to approve
\ the plans to-be submltted for Development Permission..

V. No. 402/1985.

&
-

Momugao Plan_ning and Development Authority‘
Notification
MPDA./G?O/ADM/SD 86/20

Whereas by Nofification No. 4-10-83- LAWD

~ dated 5-11-1984 * and published in the Official

Gazette No. 83 Series 1, dated 15-11-1984, Govern- -

-ment had published the Goa Daman and D1u, Town.
- and .Country Planning (Planmng and Development..

Authorities) (Fifth Amendment) Rules, 1984;
wherein the maximum and minimum Development.
Charges that may be levied by a Planmng and.




P

18TH APRIL, 1985 (CHAITRA 28, 1907)

45

Development Authority have been  prescribed and
"also the time and manner of filing an appeal under

section 103 of the Goa, Daman and Diu, Town and
Country Planning Act, 1974 (hereinafter _cal}e_d the
said “Act”). - . S

" Now, theféfore; pursuant to section 100 of the

gaid Act, and as per approval of the Government

conveyed by Under Secretary (P.W. & U.D.)’s letter
No. 4/10/83-LAWD dated 30-3-1984, following shall

be the rates of Development Charges and procedure

for applying for Development Charges, mode of
payment of Development Charges, etc.: —

1 Rates.-of Development Charges .

The Development Charges that may be levied
shall be as per the zones defined in column (1)
and at the rates specified. in the relevant columns
(2), (3) and (4) as shown in the Table below:.

Zones with - Ratefsq, m, of  Rate/sq. m.of  Rate/sq. m. of
specific FAR floor area in ~ land where uge  total land to be
- as per the case of cons- iz instituted sub-~divided
ODP/CDP of truction or changed ]
the Planning ' .
Area,
1 oz 3 Ty
250 and above Rs. 250 | Rs. 200 Rs. 2:50
2.00 ) Rs. 2.00 5 Rs. 2.00 . Rs, 2,00
1.80 ’ Rs. 1.80 Rs. 1.80 RS_. 1.80 -
1.20 C ‘Rs. 1.20 Rs. 1.20 " Rs. 1.20
1,00 and below Rs. 1.00 Rs. 1.00 Rs. 1.00

2) Procedure for applying for development charges—
(1) Subject to -the other provisions of the said
Act no development in respect of, or change of

use, of any land within the Mormugao Plannitig Area
shall be undertiken or carried out — -

(a) without payment of Development Charges
as determined by the Authority; and

{b) withiout obtaining the -certificate of pay-
ment thereof in the prescribed Form ‘¥.

(2) The personr-app'lyihg for paymént of Develop-
ment Charges shall apply to the Planning and Deve-

lopment Authority in the manner prescribed in
Form ‘C. -

A

(3) Subject to the other provisions of the said

Act, before assessment. of Development Charges,
the Town Planning Officer must provide the person
applying for the payment of Development Char
4 reasonable opportunity of being heard:

" - Provided that such opportunity should be given

within a period of less than 30 days from the date

of applying for payment of Development Charges.

8) Notice to be served in case of default —

(1), Any person, who has commenced carrying
out of any development or has carried out. such

development, or has instituted or has changed use

of land without applying in the manner prescribed

in these notifications shall be served with a notice
by the Planning and Development Authority for the"

assessment and payment of Development Charges.

. (2) Upon the service of -such notice the’ Towh

Planning Officer shall provide.the person on whom

. of Development Charges: -

ges

the motice is served ‘8 reasonable’ opportunity of
being  heard before assessment of -development
charges. : . C S - e B

1) Town Planuing Officer to deteimise Development

‘Charges — _ R .

(1) On an application being made under SL -
No. 2(2) or notice being served under Sk .I‘{o. 3{1) -
and after reasonable opportunity has been given for
hearing, the Town Planning Officer shall determine
the Development Charges payable in accordance -

. with rates fixed under these notifications. -

. (2).The Town Planning Officér -shall then
forward his report to the Authority for assessment

Provided that such report shall be: forwarded:
within 45 days.of -application or service of notice .
as the case may be. : ‘

5) Report of the Town Planning Officer to be
_considered by the Authority amnd. Development
Charges to be assessed by an order - i
(1) Subject to the other provisions of the said

Act, on receipt of the report determining the

assessment. of Development Charges the Authority

shall assess the Development Charges by an order::
Provided that the Authority may by resolution
delegate this power of assessment to a standing

technical committee consisting of not less than. 3

members. ' ‘ S o

(2) If the Authority feels that the Town Plann-

* ing Officer has not made a proper assessment of

the charges in his report the Authority may direct
the Town Planning Officer to submit a fresh report
in this regard. ) :

© (3) If the Authority feels that the Town Plann-

" ing Officer has not afforded a reasofiable opportu-

nity of being heard to the person applying for
Development Charges or ‘the .person -served with
notice, as the cdse may be, the Authority may
provide further ‘opportunity to the aggrieved person
or his representative to present his case.

T 4) The order of .assessment shall be passéd by -
‘the Authority within 60 days of application: for.

assessment of Development Charges or service of

. notiee as the case may be.

6) Refusal or postponement of "Assessment .of
Development Charges on Qe_rta,in-__g_rounds —

. The Planning- and Developmeht Authority may

refuse or postpone assessment on the following
grounds — - .

(a) Where permission under Chapter VII of the

_ said Act has not been or cannot be granted
" for carrying out the said development,. the

- Planning and Development Authority may

- -postpone the assessment of the Develop-
- ment Charges; ' '

“(b) Where the application relates to the carry-
: ing out of any development, the Authority
~may refuse to assess the development

- charges payable in respect thereof, unless

it is satisfied that the applicant has an




46

mterest in the land sufficient to enable )

~ him to carry out such development, or that
the applicant will carry out such develop-
ment, within such peridd as the Planning

+ " and Development Authority. consxders’

appropriate;

{c) Where the:application relates to the insti-

. tution of or change of use of any land the

* " Planning -and Development Authority may

refuse to assess the amount of Development

Charges payable in respect thereof unless

it is satisfied that the use will be instituted

within ' such period as the Planning and

- Development Authonty conmders appro-
priate.

7) Mode of payment of Development Gha:rges—

(1) On recelpt of the order the person mtendmg
t0 carry out the development in respect of or institute
or change use of land for which permission under
Chapter VII of the daid Aect is necessary shall pay

the ‘assessed charges by Challan or Demand Draft’

payable to the Mormugao Planmng and Development
Au’chorlty

(2) ‘The- Mormugao Planmng and’ Development,

Authomty shall acknowledge the rece1pt in the’ pree-
cmbed Form ‘F’

A copy of Form ‘F* will be attached to the relevant
apphcatlon for which permission is required under
Chapter VI, of the sald Act.

8) Appeal aml Penal Prowsmn -—'

(i) Appeal agamst the Development Charges
assessed under ‘this Notification shall be made as
prescribed under. section 103 of the sdid Act and
under Rule 20 (b) of the Goa, Daman and Diu Town

and Country Planning (Planning and Development
Authomtles) Rules, 1977.

- (2) Al the ~defaulting Development Charges g
1mposed under this Notification shall be recoverable

s per sectlon 104 of the sa;ld Act.
"T. Neogy, Member Secretary
:Mormugao 4th Apnl 1985

_FORM. c
" {See Rule 20)

Form of appheamon for the assessment
of Development Charges

g 'The'ébe. Daman and Diu Town and Coun'}ry Plenning Act, 1974,
(Act 21 of 1975)

Sir, . . :

T hereby give notlce under sub-sectmn (1) of Sectmn 102 .

of the Act that I intend to carry out/I am carrying out/l
have carried out development mentioned ‘below and request
you to sssess the development charge, if any, peyable in
respect thereof under Sectmn 100 of the Act,

. 8ERIES I No. 8

. 1) Nature of Development:
2) ‘Location: — :

Signature of owner
" Address:

Note The Form i o4 should ‘be accompamed by the tcllowmg- '
documents:

: 1) The ownership or r:ght or interest in land suff:cient
to enable the applicant” to carry out thé’ intended
development — supported by the following doeuments
{wherever apphcable),

- a) Certified copy of the plan of the land from the
Directorate of Land Survey.

b) Index of Land in Form III I & XIV or. Clty
‘Survey Reo'lster

c) Sale/G:ft/Lease/Mortgage and or any other ing-
© trument of assignment.

2) Plans of t~he proposed deveIopment showmg

a) A complete site plan @ scale of rot less than :
1:500. . .

b} Detaxled Statement of areas, eoverage, setbacks,
F. A.R. permissible & consumed, open - spaces,
Iengtn of roads and drains (if any), compound
walls and gates and any other type of development:

(including changes of use-of land or sub-division® '~

of- land).
¢} Date of com’rnencement of"construetion.'
- d) ‘Any other relevant document or plan.

3) Al documents should be s1g'ned by the person’ holding
| sufficient interest. in..the land to carry out the
mtended development .

N B —'I‘he assessment of development charge under
Section 102 of the Act does not bind the Authomty
to approve the’ plans to be submitted for development
permlssmn

CTown PIanning Officer

1) Name of ASSESSEEI ...i..iivererstimirosimnnicniitii s
(mth complete Address)

TO BE FILLED BY AUTHORITY

2) Explam in short if.-assessee has sufficient interest, in
land to carry out development: :

3) Survey No. and City/Village, of plot to be developed: ...
4). Nature of Development (strike out what is not necessary)

. i) Single Family/Multi-family dwelling (ii) Commer-

. cial/Public- & Semi-Public Bullding (iii) Industrial
Building {iv) Bmldmg for Transport and Commuti- .
_eation,. -

“v) Other bu1ld1ngs (Speczfy) ............... rerrarenanee

v1) Sub—diwsmn of land.:.

vii) Chang‘e in land/bmldmg use (spec1fy)

,5) Zone of Area as per ODP/CDP STV eereenesian

6) Is the propnsed development as per Rules"




18TH APRIL, 1985 (CHAITRA 28, 1907)

a7

7) Method of assessment (sq. mis. floor area/sq. mts of
langd area/running mgtre)

RT3 N W T O OO SR

. . DEALING HAND |

ASSESSMENT ORDER NO. ,...cocovitns DTV Lt
i) Application duly made in Form ‘C’ and hearing completed.
i) Assessment made after service ‘of ‘potice and hearing

- completed. - .- : o « . L

iii). Best judgement raséessment. made as applicant.did not
attend hearing. . .- . B S UL PR
Developrent. charges payable Rs. L....iooiiloeiios
" RUODPEES weoiireeeerarnnns ). : o
iv) Assessiment is refiised/postponed . for the . following
reasons: - A i s

| TOWN PLANNING OFFICER
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

Receipt NO. v.vvvvnneeeeereri @by coeneseenneeeingih

The Mormugao Planting and Development ‘Authority ‘has

received by Challan/Demand Draft No. ..

dated ..... e +eevqe towards payment of ' Development
Charges towards Order No. ....cc.c.coouvennne.... dated ...
The amount of Rs, ........... riveeiees (RUPEES Liiveieiini., )

REMARKS:
.................................. T
N B

.*The dssessment’ of ‘development charge under sé¢tion
102.0f the Act does not bing the Authority to approve
the plans to be submiited for De\[elopment Permission.

oH0-8-
e

Tourism, information andTr
" Notification . _
L ASSBEDG)

" The followingdra.ft of certain rules firther “to

amend the Goa, Daman and Din Motor. Vehicles Rules,

1965, which the Government of Go3; Daman and Din -
1, 217, 41 and 68

proposes to make under sections 2
of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1939

1939) are hereby published as re
tion (1) of section 133 of the said

(Central Act 4 o
quired by -sub-g _
Act, for the infar

" V. No. 387/1985

ansport Deparfment -

" the werds-“ (five) ru

. mation of.all persons likely to be ‘affected thereby

and notice is hereby given that the said draft rules
will be taken into consideration by the Government
on or after the expiry of thirty days froin the date

- of .publication. of this notification in_the Official

2. All objections and suggestion to the said draft -
rules may be forwarded to the Under Secretary to .

 the Government of Goa, Daman and Diu, Tourism,

Information & Transport Department, Secretariat,
Panaji, Goa, within fifteen days from the date of
publication of this notification in ‘' the Official -
Gazette. g o

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 21,
section 21J, section 41 and section 68 of the Motor
Vehicles Act, 1939 (Central Act'4 of 1939) and all -

other powers enabling him in that behalf, the Admi- -
_nistrator of Goa, Daman and Diu hereby makes the

following rules, to further amend the Goa, Daman
and Diu Motor. Vehicles Rules, ;965, namely: —

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) These

" rules may be called the Goa, Daman and Diu Motor .

Vehicles (Amendment) Rules, 1985. L
.(2,) 'I‘hey shall comeé into force at once. -

" 2. Amendment of rule 2.2.—In clavse (viii)} of
- . rule 2.2 of the Goa, Daman and Diu Mofor Vehicles

Rules, 1965 (hereinafter called the “Principal rules”),
for the words “two rupees”, the words “five rupees”
shall be substituted. o S '

3. Amendment of rule 2.3, — In clause (ii) of rule
2.3 of the principal rules, for the words “five rupees”,
the words “ten rupees” shall be substituted.

‘4. Amendment of rule 2.7. — In clause (vi) of rule
2.7 of the principal rules, for the words “five rupees”,
the words “twenty rupees”, shall be substituted.
5. Amendment of rulé 2.8, — In clause (iv) of rule
2.8 of the principal rules, for the words “five rupees”,

‘the words “twenty rupees”, shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of rale 2.9. — In clause (iv) of rule
2.9-of the principal rules, for the words “five rupees”,

- the words “twenty rupees”, shall be substituted.-

“7. Amendment of rule 2.13. — In clause (i) of rule
2.13 of the principal rules, for the words “three
rupees”, the words “five rupees” shall be subsﬁiputerd.
~ 8. Amendment of rule 3.10.—1In sub-rule (3) of rule
3.10 of the principal  rules, for the words “two
rupees”, the words “five ripees” shall be substituted.
2o, Amendment of rule '3.11._.—-_—?"In' sub-rule (4) of
rule 3.11 of the principal rules, for the words “ten
rupees”, the words “twenty rupees” shall be substi-

tuted. :

- 10. Amendment of rule 3.4, - In sub-rule (1) of -
rule 3.14 of the principal rules, for the words “five
rupees”, .the words “one hundred rupees” 'shall be - -
Substituted. - - e
_11. Amendment of rule 3.15. — In stub-rule (2) of
rule 3.15: of the principal rules; for the words “five
rupees”, the words “ten rupees” shall be substituted,

- 12, Amendment of rule 3.16. — In sub-rule (2) of

rule 3.16"of the principal rules, for the bracket and

+

Lie w pees”, the words “twenty rupees”
shall be substituted C yHipes

N




48'

v L SERIES I No-3

13. ‘Amendment of ruie 3 19 -—In rule 3 19 of the
principal -rules — :

A .(e.) m sub-rule 1), —

(1) in .clause (a), for the words “Twelve i
pees”, the words “Twenty rupees” shali be
substituted;

(i) in clause (b), for the Words “Elghteen
rupees”, the words “Thu'ty rupees" shall ‘be
substituted;” - _

(ili) in clanse (c), for the Words “Th:rty snxl
- rupees”; the words “Flfty rupees”. shall: be subs-

' tituted;

(iv) mclause {d), for t’he words “Flve rupees "y

the words “Teii rupees" shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-rule (2) for the words. “bwo Tupees”;

‘the words “Ten rupees” shall be substltuted

14, Ameniment of rule 321, — In sub-rule (6) of )

rule 3.21 of the pnnclpal rules e

(1) for the words “a sum of ten rupees” the

words “a, sum’ of twenty Tupees” shall be subs—
- tltuted T

‘(i) for thé words “No fee shall be pa.yable”

the words “A fee of rupees ten sha,ll be payable”
' sha.ll ‘e substituted;

© (iii) for the words “e further fee of rupees two”, o

. “the ‘words “a further fee of rupees ten” shall be
‘substituted.

15. Amendment of rule 3 26.—In. sub-rule (3) of
rule 3.26 of the principal rules, for the words *one
hundred rupees” and “fifty rupees” the words “two
hundred ‘2nd fifty rupees” and “one hundred and
twenty fwe rupees” respect:LVer shall be substltuted

16 Amendment of rule 4. 14 —In rule 4 14 of the
‘prlnmpa.l rules —

(i} in sub-rule (1) for the words “twenty ru-
pees”, and-*“five rupees” the words “forty rupees”
-and “ten rupees” respeetwely shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-rule (2), for the words “five 1 rupees”
the words “ten rupees” shall be substituted.

"17. Amendment of rale 4.25. — In sub-rule (2) of
rule 4.25 of the principal rules, for the words “five

rupees”, the words “twenty five rupees’ shall be_-

substltuted

"

18 Amendment of rule 4.28. — In sub-rule (4) of

rule 4.28 of the principal rules, for the words “No
fee shall be chargeable”, the words “A’ fee of rupees
twenty shall be chargeable” shall be substituted.

" 19. Amendment of rule 4. 31.— In rule 4.31 of the

principal rules, for the words “five rupees” the
words “ten rupees” shall be substituted. =

20. Amendment of rule 4.33. — In sub-rule {5) of

rule 4.33 of the principal rules, for the words “five

rupees” the words “ten rupees” shall be substituted.

1. Amendment of rule 4.36. —In rule 4 36°of the

principal rules—

~ (i).in sub-rule (3); for theewerds ‘_«tWen;y:m.
- pees”; the words “fifty rupees” ,_shgl; be _substitute:d.

“{ii) -in sitb-tule (4) for the words “fifty paise”

the words “five rupees” shall be eubstltuted
29 Amendment of rule 447.— In the proviso to

- gub-rule (10) of rule 4.47 of the principal rules, for

the words “one’ rupee” the werds “ten rupees” sha.ll-
be substituted. ‘

23, Amendment of rule 447 8. — M sub-rule {4) -

of rule 44-7B of thé principal rules, for the words

“fifty paise”, the words “five rupees” shall be subs-
tituted. : . .

24 Amendment of mle 448 In sub~ru1e 3) of_

rule 4.48 of the principal rules, for the words “three

rupees”, the words “ten rupees” shall be substituted.’

.25, Amendment of rule 4.49.— In sub-rule (3) of
rule 449 of the principal rules, for the words “three

rupees”, the words “ten rupees” shall be substltuted ,

By order and in the name of the I.aeutenant
" Governor of Goa, Daman and Diu.

. 8. D. Sadhale, U_nder Secretary (STE).
Panaji, 9th April, 1985,

indusiries and l._ab_our Depariment

Notification
| 25/8/85ILD

Whereas the Government of Goa, Darman and
Diu, with the approval of the Central Government,

- intends to apply all the provisions of the Ma.termty '
Benefit  Aet, 1961 (Central Act 53 of 1961) to the

fellovnng classes of establishinents, _namely: —
- iy Local bodies;

i) " Farms organised on a commercml scale,

iii) Hospitals and other medical institutions;

i) Administrative offices of factories, mines

which are covered under the Act and

v} Trading and commercial establishments

such - as banks

(including cooperative
banks).

Now, Therefore, in exercise of the powers con-

ferred by the prowso ‘to sub-gection (1) of section 2
of the said Act, the Government of Goa, Daman
and Diu heréby gives two months’ notice of ‘its
intention to apply all the provisions of the said Act

to the classes of establishments specified above.

Any suggestions or-objections may be forwarded

to the Secretary, Industries and Labour Department,'
Secretariat, Panaji-Goa, within a period of two
months from the date of pubhca.tlon of thls Noti-

fmatmn m the Offmzal Gazette.

By order a.nd in the name of the Admmlstrator
, of Goa, Daman and Diu.

Subhash V. E’lekar, Under Secretary (Industmes
and Labour), . .

- ,1?311?5*36*11 April, 1985,

| GOVT. pnmmebmi&zs Goa .
(Imprensa Nasionat — Goa)
L — 085 Py




